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Prequalification Requirements - Bonding Requirements - Pricing Increases - Bid Validity Period 

 
1. Certificate of Qualification:  Subcontractors whose work will equal or exceed $150,000 must 

attain a Certificate of Qualification by the Indiana Dept. of Administration Public Works Division 
Certification Board before commencing any work on this project.  For more information, 
visit: IDOA Contractors and Subcontractors. If you are already certified by the State of Indiana 
Department of Administration, Public Works Division, please upload your certificate to your 
iSqFt profile or forward a copy to Lisa Trusler, Director of Administration. 
(ltrusler@hannigconstruction.com). 
 

2. MBE, WBE, IVOSB Certification:  Hannig Construction, Inc., also seeks qualified/certified XBE 
subcontractors to submit bids for the project. The project goal for participation is 7% MBE, 5% 
WBE and 3% IVOSB. To certify your business as an MBE, WBE, or IVOSB, visit https: IDOA 
Division of Supplier Diversity.The project goal for participation is 7% MBE, 5% WBE and 3% 
IVOSB. If you are already certified by the State of Indiana Department of Administration, 
Division of Supplier Diversity, please upload your certificate to your iSqFt profile or forward a 
copy to Lisa Trusler, Director of Administration. (ltrusler@hannigconstruction.com). 

 
3. Bonding:  All subcontractors with bids totaling $1 million or more must submit as a separate line 

item with your bid the cost to furnish Performance/Payment Bonds for the full amount of the 
award. This applies if your base bid OR base bid + any alternates totals $1 million or more. By 
submitting this price, you are verifying that your firm is capable of bonding this project. A 
decision will be made prior to contract award whether or not bonds are required from your 
Company. If you have any questions regarding this, please contact Wes Readinger, President. 

 
4. Pricing Increases:  Any subcontractors/suppliers anticipating increases in material items, 

including but not limited to steel, aluminum, etc., are to account for this increase in their bid. No 
additional costs will be accepted after the bid or after contract award for increases in material 
costs occurring in the future. 

 
5. Bid Validity Period:  In accordance with Item 04.O Instructions to Bidders of the Specifications, 

bids/pricing must be held for a period of sixty (60) days after the date of the bid opening, or 
unless extended in accordance with IC 4-13.6-6-4. This should be taken into consideration in the 
amount of your bid, and no additional costs will be accepted after the bid or after contract 
award for increases which occur during this time period or in the future. 
 

 

 

https://www.in.gov/idoa/state-property-and-facilities/public-works/certification-board/contractors-and-sub-contractors/
https://www.in.gov/idoa/mwbe/minority-and-womens-business-enterprises/certify-your-business/
https://www.in.gov/idoa/mwbe/minority-and-womens-business-enterprises/certify-your-business/

